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Service Summary

Visitation
6:00 PM to 8:00 PM, Thu Aug 16,
2012

Vidalia Chapel
1722 Mt Vernon Road
Vidalia, Georgia 30474

Funeral Service
11:00 AM Fri Aug 17, 2012

Vidalia Chapel
1722 Mt Vernon Road
Vidalia, Georgia 30474

Obituary

Died: Sunday, August 12, 2012

Miss Kerri Ann Hall, age 21 of Ailey was called home to be
with Jesus early Sunday morning, August 12, 2012 in
Panama City Beach, Florida as a result of  injuries she
received in an automobile accident.

Kerri was a native of Covington Ga., resided in Augusta for
many years and has made her home in Vidalia for the past 7
years.  She graduated from Vidalia High School in 2010 and
was employed by CVS Pharmacy in Vidalia.  Kerri attended
the Tabernacle Baptist Church in Vidalia. 

Kerri is survived by her mother and step-father, Tina and Phil
Giles of Milledgeville; her father and step-mother, Terry and
Teri Hall of Vidalia; a twin brother, Ty Hall of Statesboro;
five sisters, Heather Hall of Milledgeville, Tiffany Pruett of
Covington, Shannon Buckhault of Conyers, Shelley Roper of
Mishawaka, Indiana and Carmen Giles of Milledgeville.  She
is also survived by Paternal Grandparents William and
Madge Coleman of Cherryville, NC.

Funeral Services for Kerri Ann Hall will be held Friday
August 17, 2012 at 11 am in the Ronnie L. Stewart Funeral
Service chapel in Vidalia with Reverend Chester Proctor
officiating. A Graveside service will be held at 3:30 pm
Friday afternoon in the West View Cemetery in Monticello,
with burial to follow.  The family will receive friends
Thursday evening August 16, 2012 from 6:00 – 8:00 PM at
the Ronnie L. Stewart Funeral Service Chapel in Vidalia.

Ronnie L. Stewart Funeral Service of Vidalia is in charge of
the arrangements. 
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